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1 July 2020 to 30 September 2020 
 

Ref No Request Response 
290720 I would like you, OPCC Northumbria to 

disclose under FOIA the following 
information concerning Staffordshire Police's  
review ' the investigation  - as requested by 
PCC Baird / OPCC Northumbria) into claims 
(Northumbria) 'police covered up' sex 
scandal bust-up as Line of Duty cops quiz 
ex-chiefs .... ; 
 
1.   What date/s was the interim report/s 
(including any draft/s) disclosed to you and 
or OPCC Northumbria? 
 
2.   What date /s was the full / final report/s 
(including any draft/s) disclosed to you and 
or OPCC Northumbria?  
 
3.   When will you, OPCC Northumbria be 
disclosing the report/s to the public? 
 
4.   Regards 3 above, If you, OPCC 
Northumbria are not going to disclose the 
report/s to the public... what are your, OPCC 
Northumbria's reason/s and rationale for not 
doing so? 

Further to your Freedom of Information request, please find below our 
response. 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner - Northumbria  

www.northumbria-pcc.gov.uk 
 
 
 
1.   What date/s was the interim report/s (including any draft/s) disclosed to 
you and or OPCC Northumbria? -  An interim report was received in 
June 2019 
  
2.   What date /s was the full / final report/s (including any draft/s) disclosed 
to you and or OPCC Northumbria? - The final report was received in 
July 2020 
  
3.   When will you, OPCC Northumbria be disclosing the report/s to the 
public?  No information is held. 
 
  
4.   Regards 3 above, If you, OPCC Northumbria are not going to disclose 
the report/s to the public... what are your, OPCC Northumbria's reason/s 
and rationale for not doing so? No information held.   
  
 

http://www.northumbria-pcc.gov.uk/


Ref No Request Response 
 
5.     What was the outcome, the findings of 
that interim investigation / the report i.e. 
a. Has any misconduct / gross misconduct 
been identified, If so, please supply details 
as well of type of misconduct/ gross 
misconduct etc. 
b. Were any type of referrals made to the 
IOPC/IPCC and or has any file/s been 
submitted to CPS / DPP concerning the 
findings (including to date)?  
If so, when - to whom, dates?  If Not,  are 
you aware of any plans to do so? 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
5.   What was the outcome, the findings of that interim investigation / the 
report i.e. 
 
a. Has any misconduct / gross misconduct been identified, If so, please 
supply details as well of type of misconduct/ gross misconduct etc.  – We 
apply Section 22 – Information intended for future publication 
 
Public Interest Test 
 
Factors favouring disclosure:- 

To release the information that is held at this particular time would 
provide the public with an awareness of the most recently collected 
data serving to enhance public knowledge of the subject, by providing 
current information that may better inform public debate on the 
decisions taken by Northumbria Police. 
 

Factors favouring non-disclosure:- 
As you will be aware from information already in the public domain, 
this is a high profile matter involving a number of individual 
people.  However, Northumbria Police accept that this is a subject of 
great public interest and accordingly, a decision has been made to 
consider publishing this information in the future when it has been fully 
assessed and it is appropriate to do so 
 
Balancing Test 
 
To clarify for a disclosure of this nature to be appropriate, a valid 
reason or reasons which identify a tangible benefit to the public from 
disclosure of information needs to identified.  In this case a decision 
has been made to fully consider the disclosure of the information at a 
future date and the information is verified as accurate.  Section 22 
allows for circumstances when it is reasonable and correct for public 
authorities to delay the provision of information until it is made 



Ref No Request Response 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
6.   How many pages is the interim report / 
findings? 
 
 
7.   How many pages is the full / final report / 
findings? 
As well as the above I am also request  
following; 
 
8.     A copy (a copy original document/s 
please) of Staffordshire Police's interim 
investigation report and findings   -including 
draft/s - into said investigation? 
 
 
 
 
 

generally available through publication.  The additional resources 
expended by the force to deal with your request at this time would not 
be in the public interest. 
 
For the reasons outlined above the balancing test for disclosure at this 
time is not made out.  
 
b. Were any type of referrals made to the IOPC/IPCC and or has any file/s 
been submitted to CPS / DPP concerning the findings (including to 
date)?     Answer as above  
 
 
If so, when - to whom, dates?  If Not,  are you aware of any plans to do so? 
- NA 
  
6.   How many pages is the interim report / findings?                   93 pages 
 
 
 
         
7.   How many pages is the full / final report / findings?              111 pages 
  
As well as the above I am also request  following; 
 
 
8.     A copy (a copy original document/s please) of Staffordshire 
Police's interim investigation report and findings   -including draft/s - into 
said investigation? We apply Section 40 – Personal Data applies.   
 

Section 40 (2) - Personal Information  

Section 40 (2) is a class based absolute exemption and there is no 
requirement to consider the public interest in disclosure. That being 
said where Section 40(2) is engaged in order to make the exemption 
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9.     A copy (a copy original document/s 
please) of Staffordshire Police's  full / final - 
including draft/s -investigation report and 
findings into said investigation? 
Any redactions that are made to report/s, 
the findings should only be applied were 
absolutely necessary. 
 

 

absolute there needs to be evidence that a data protection principle 
would be breached by disclosure. In this case it would not be lawful 
or fair to process information which, we believe by providing all the 
information you have requested, could lead to the identification of an 
individual. Therefore the first principle of the Data Protection Act 
would be breached.  

 
 
9.     A copy (a copy original document/s please) of Staffordshire 
Police's  full / final - including draft/s -investigation report and findings into 
said investigation?  We apply Section 40 – Personal Data applies.   
 

Section 40 (2) - Personal Information  

Section 40 (2) is a class based absolute exemption and there is no 
requirement to consider the public interest in disclosure. That being 
said where Section 40(2) is engaged in order to make the exemption 
absolute there needs to be evidence that a data protection principle 
would be breached by disclosure. In this case it would not be lawful 
or fair to process information which, we believe by providing all the 
information you have requested, could lead to the identification of an 
individual. Therefore the first principle of the Data Protection Act 
would be breached.  

 

030820 To whom it may concern,  
  
I would like to make the below FOI 

request, on behalf of XXXXXX. Could 
we have the data from the last year 
(2019/2020) – the latest information 
you have.  

OPCC does not hold information, passed to Northumbria Police FOI 
team. 



Ref No Request Response 
I would be grateful if you could provide 

answers to the following questions  
  

 How many individuals that reported 
an incident of domestic abuse had 
‘No Recourse to Public Funds’ 
attached to their immigration 
status. Please also give as a 
percentage of all reported incidents of 
domestic abuse.  

 How many individuals that reported 
an incident of domestic abuse had 
migrant status. Please also give as a 
percentage of all reported incidents of 
domestic abuse.  

 Please list the types of VISA’s, or 
classification of immigration status 
(i.e. seeking asylum, work visa etc) 
that individuals that reported 
domestic abuse had, and the number 
of each type. Please also give the 
percentage of each type.  

 How many individuals that reported 
an incident of domestic abuse had 
migrant status and were offered 
access to a refuge? Please also give 
as a percentage.   

 How many individuals that reported 
an incident of domestic abuse had 
migrant status and were offered 
access to domestic abuse support 



Ref No Request Response 
services? Please also give as a 
percentage.   

 How many individuals that reported 
an incident of domestic abuse had 
migrant status, attempted access to 
refuge, but were not able to access it 
at that point? How many of these had 
‘NRPF’ attached to their immigration 
status? Please also give as 
percentages.  

 How many migrant victims of 
domestic abuse have reported who 
could not access the Domestic 
Violence Destitution Concession 
(DDVC) because they were not on a 
spousal visa?   

 How much police budget was spent 
on emergency accommodation for 
individuals that have migrant status, 
that had reported domestic abuse?   

 How many times has an individual 
that has reported domestic abuse 
stayed overnight at a police station 
after reporting an incident? How 
many of these individuals had 
migrant status? Please also give as 
percentages.  

050820 Subject Access Request received as FOI. Advised that OPCC does not hold information and that request has 
been passed to Northumbria Police.  

050820 (2) Subject Access Request received as FOI. Advised that OPCC does not hold information and that request has 
been passed to Northumbria Police. 
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160820 In respect of grants made by the Home 

Office from the Safer Streets Fund please 
provide the following information: 
 
1. Did your office apply? 
2. Provide a copy of your application(s) 
3 Provide a copy of any grant letter(s) 
received together with any conditions 
attached to the grant(s) 4. Any information 
held with regards to ongoing revenue costs 
not covered by the Home Office grant. 
 

Advised that Northumbria Police did not receive funding through the 
Safer Streets Fund. 

 

 
 
 
 
 


